2022-2023 ELIPS Spring Pipe Materials Bid Summary

March 31, 2022 11:00am Bid Opening

Supplier| ENG Estimate Ferguson - Pasco OoVsS -Zillah Core & Main - Pasco
Bid Bond X X X
Debarment X X X
Signed Proposal Form X X X
Addendum #1 X X X
Schedule of Prices X X X
Schedule A - IPS Pipe
Total Bid Amount $50,604.05 $45,498.89 $43,103.66 NO BID
Schedule B - IPS Pipe
Total Bid Amount $106,392.53 $103,415.44 $82,913.93 NO BID
Schedule C - PIP Pipe
Total Bid Amount $76,180.50 $72,327.60 NO BID $81,368.55
Schedule D - C900 Pipe
Total Bid Amount|  51,239,651.86 $1,183,988.88 NO BID $1,226,309.76
Schedule E - PVC Fittings
Total Bid Amount|  5146,827.47 $69,771.49 $76,999.37 $74,441.46
Schedule F - Valves, Vents, and Fittings
Total Bid Amount|  5144,727.91 $141,511.27 NO BID $121,606.42
Schedule G - Steel Pipe
Total Bid Amount $22,443.22 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Vender Total $1,326,087.97 $126,017.59 $121,606.42
Bid Total| $1,786,827.54 $1,573,711.99




