MABTON CANAL IMPROVEMENT PROJECT MP 12.48 RESERVOIR JULY 2, 2010 10:30AM

ORDER ITEM NO. 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 CALCULATED

CONTRACTOR TOTAL WRITEN TOTAL DIFFERENCE
2[JNJ Construction S 12,600.00 | S 10,000.00 | S 15,500.00 | $ 29,250.00 | S 74,960.00 | S 15,600.00 | S 10,500.00 | S 168,410.00 | § 168,410.00 | § 91,590.00

Tri-State Construction s - S - S - S - S - S - S - S - NO BID S 260,000.00
6|Conrad Russell Excavation LLC S - S 19,500.00 | S - $ 212,500.00 | s 70,000.00 | S 45,500.00 | $§ 16,500.00 | $ 364,000.00 | $ 364,000.00 | $ (104,000.00)
3|Evans & Sons S 15,350.00 | $ 4,000.00 | S 34,000.00 | $§ 16,500.00 | S 72,000.00 | § 21,000.00 | § 22,500.00 | S 185,350.00 | § 185,350.00 | $ 74,650.00

RP & E Construction Inc S - S - S - S - S - S - S - S - NO BID S 260,000.00

Selland Construction Inc S - S - S - S - S - S - S - S - NO BID S 260,000.00
4|Hilmes Construction Inc S 10,000.00 | S 8,000.00 | S 40,000.00 | § 18,500.00 | S 68,000.00 | S 21,500.00 | $ 20,000.00 | § 186,000.00 | § 186,000.00 | § 74,000.00

Belsaas & Smith Const. Co S - S - S - S - S - $ - S - S - NO BID S 260,000.00
5|Rotschy Inc S 38,891.60 | $ 5,978.50 | § 11,669.10 | S 34,362.98 | $ 86,474.72 | $ 26,600.81 | § 26,246.39 | § 230,224.10 | § 230,224.10 | S 29,775.90

Ray Poland & Sons Inc S - $ - S - S - S - S - S - S - NO BID S 260,000.00

TNT Excavation & Heavfy Hauling S - S - S - S - S - S - S - S - NO BID S 260,000.00
1|Ag Pro Repair & Fabrication, Inc. S 5,760.00 | § 4,234.00 | S 23,040.00 | S 10,358.00 | S 72,000.00 | § 10,358.00 | S 23,040.00 | $ 150,852.06 | $ 150,852.06 | S 109,147.94

Gunkel Construction S - S - S - S - S - S - $ - S - NO BID S 260,000.00

$ = $ - $ - S = S = $ = 5 . $ ® S - S 260,000.00
ENGINEERS ESTIMATE | $  260,000.00 |
Acknowledge | Bid Schedule of List of suppliers/

CONTRACTOR Addenda 1,2,3 Prices Bid Bond subcontractors

JNJ Construction X X X X

Tri-State Construction NO BID

Conrad Russell Excavation LLC X NO BID BOND

Evans & Sons X X X X

RP & E Construction Inc NO BID

Selland Construction Inc NO BID

Hilmes Construction Inc X X X X

Belsaas & Smith Const. Co NO BID

Rotschy Inc X X X

Ray Poland & Sons Inc NO BID

TNT Excavation & Heavfy Hauling NO BID

Ag Pro Repair & Fabrication, Inc. X X X NO BID BOND

Gunkel Construction NO BID




