
Sunnyside Division Board of Control RH2 Engineering, Inc

Phase II Enclosed Lateral Improvement Projects August 30, 2011

Contract 11-001: Region 005, 006, 009, 010W and 012 Sunnyside, WA

Bid Summary Sheet

Contractor Company Name City/State Subtotal Schedule A Subtotal Schedule B Subtotal Schedule C

1 POW Contracting Pasco, WA 1 $1,075,180.30 6 $3,740,843.30 2 $1,141,539.80

2 KRCI East Wenatchee, WA 2 $1,134,118.00 No Bid No Bid

3 Rotschy, Inc Vancouver, WA 3 $1,214,000.00 5 $3,659,893.00 5 $1,281,890.00

4 Scarsella Brothers Seattle, WA 4 $1,243,205.00 4 $3,590,625.50 6 $1,343,792.00

5 Moore Excavation Portland, OR 5 $1,244,406.00 8 $4,162,940.00 7 $1,344,210.00

6 Apollo Construction Kennewick, WA 6 $1,332,498.00 3 $3,515,438.00 4 $1,237,433.50

7 Strider Construction Bellingham, WA 7 $1,507,379.00 7 $4,010,020.00 No Bid

8 Knife River Coeur d'Alene, ID 8 $1,670,773.00 No Bid 8 $1,393,492.50

9 Tri-State Construction Portland, OR 9 $2,060,359.20 9 $5,110,213.00 9 $1,635,500.00

10 Tapani Underground Battle Ground, WA 10 No Bid 2 $3,343,551.00 1 $1,140,237.70

11 Premier Excavation Richland, WA 11 No Bid No Bid 3 $1,177,175.00

12 Emery & Sons Salem, OR No Bid 1 $3,269,115.00 No Bid

Engineer's Estimate $1,342,855.00 $4,488,516.00 $1,563,015.00


